

**Chemical Bids**

**BID TABULATION SHEET**  
**Bids opened Wednesday, February 5, 2020 at 5:00 PM**

**Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items**

	Calcium Chloride Sales, Inc 713 W Main St Grove City, PA 16127 <u>NAME OF BIDDER</u>	Kuehne Chemical Co Inc 86 N Hackensack Ave Kearny, NJ 07032 <u>NAME OF BIDDER</u>	<b>NO BID BOND</b> George S Coyne Chemical Co 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021-6997 <u>NAME OF BIDDER</u>	Thatcher Company of New York, Inc P.O Box 27407 Salt Lake City, UT 84127-0407 <u>NAME OF BIDDER</u>	Evoqua Water Technologies LLC 2650 Tallevast Road Sarasota, FL 34243 <u>NAME OF BIDDER</u>
A. 150 lb. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
C. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb. (or 1.274 per gallon) \$0.1316 per lb.
D. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb. (\$182.065 per wet ton)	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
E. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	\$0.0910325 per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
F. Liquid Sulphur Dioxide in one ton containers	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton
G. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in Bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per gal	<u>No Bid</u> per gal	<u>No Bid</u> per gal	<u>No Bid</u> per gal	<u>No Bid</u> per gal
H. Sodium Permanganate 40% liquid/55 gal. drums	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<b>NO BID BOND</b> \$1.7563 per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
I. Liquid Caustic Soda in Bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	\$0.2128 per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
J. Sodium Hypochlorite Liquid 12% in bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	\$0.135 per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
K. Liquid Copper Pentahydrate in 55 gal. contnrs (Earthtec)	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at meeting held Wednesday, February 26, 2020 at 6:00 pm*

**Chemical Bids**

**BID TABULATION SHEET**

**Bids opened Wednesday, February 5, 2020 at 5:00 PM**

**Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items**

	* Usalco Baltimore Plant, LLC 2601 Cannery Avenue Baltimore, MD 21226 NAME OF BIDDER	Brenntag Northeast 81 W. Huller Lane Reading, PA 19605 NAME OF BIDDER	Gulbrandsen Technologies Inc 2 Main St P.O. BoX 5523 Clinton, NJ 08809 NAME OF BIDDER	Chemtrade Chemicals Us LLC 90 East Halsey Road Suite 200 Parsippany, NJ 07054 NAME OF BIDDER	* Univar Solutions Usa Inc 200 Dean Sievers Place Morrisville, PA 19067 NAME OF BIDDER
A. 150 lb. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	* <u>\$1.02</u> per lb.
B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	* <u>\$0.70</u> per lb.
C. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
D. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>\$0.255</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>\$0.2645</u> per lb. wet lb assay basis 23%
E. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads	* <u>\$0.087265</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>\$0.1157</u> per lb. (\$231.40 per liquid ton)	<u>No Bid</u> per lb. (per ton cylinder)
F. Liquid Sulphur Dioxide in one ton containers	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> perTon	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	* <u>\$1,390.00</u> per Ton
G. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in Bulk	* <u>\$1.5096</u> per gal	<u>No Bid</u> per gal	<u>\$1.99</u> per gal	<u>\$3.852</u> per gal	<u>No Bid</u> per gal
H. Sodium Permanganate 40% liquid/55 gal. drums	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>\$1.85</u> per lb. (per wet lb.)	<u>No Bid</u> per lb..	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.
I. Liquid Caustic Soda in Bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>\$0.1358</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	* <u>\$0.125</u> per lb.
J. Sodium Hypochlorite Liquid 12% in bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	* <u>\$0.097</u> per lb.
K. Liquid Copper Pentahydrate in 55 gal. contnrs (Earthtec)	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	* <u>\$16.49</u> per gal.

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at meeting held Wednesday, February 26, 2020 at 6:00 pm*

**Chemical Bids**

**BID TABULATION SHEET**

**Bids opened Wednesday, February 5, 2020 at 5:00 PM**

**NO BID BOND**

* Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 4321 W. 6th Street Lawrence, KS 66049	* Shannon Chemical Corp P.O. Box 376 Malvern, PA 19355	Holland Company, Inc 153 Howland Avenue Adams, MA 01220-1199
---	--	--

**Alternate #1-Bids for Individual Items**

	NAME OF BIDDER	NAME OF BIDDER	NAME OF BIDDER	NAME OF BIDDER	NAME OF BIDDER
A. 150 lb. cylinders of Liquid Chlorine	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
B. One ton containers of Liquid Chlorine	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
C. Ferrous Sulphate Liquid in full tanker loads	* (Kemira pix-206) <u>\$0.0804</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
D. Hydrofluosilicic Acid in bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	* <u>\$0.247</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
E. Liquid Alum in full tanker loads	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<b>NO BID BOND</b> (\$300.00 per liquid ton) <u>\$0.15</u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
F. Liquid Sulphur Dioxide in one ton containers	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>No Bid</u> per Ton	<u>                    </u> per Ton	<u>                    </u> per Ton
G. Liquid Polyaluminum Chloride in Bulk	(Kemira pax-XL6) <u>\$1.847</u> per gal	<u>No Bid</u> per gal	<b>NO BID BOND</b> <u>\$2.45</u> per gal	<u>                    </u> per gal	<u>                    </u> per gal
H. Sodium Permanganate 40% liquid/55 gal. drums	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	* <u>\$1.81</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb..	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
I. Liquid Caustic Soda in Bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
J. Sodium Hypochlorite Liquid 12% in bulk	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>No Bid</u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.	<u>                    </u> per lb.
K. Liquid Copper Pentahydrate in 55 gal. contnrs (Earthtec)	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>No Bid</u> per gal.	<u>                    </u> per gal.	<u>                    </u> per gal.

*Indicates successful bidder awarded at meeting held Wednesday, February 26, 2020 at 6:00 pm*