
BID  TABULATION  SHEET

BIDS OPENED  WEDNESDAY,  February 5, 2020 at 5:00 PM

Snow & Ice Rock Salt

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP AMERICAN ROCK SALT CO CALCIUM CHLORIDE SALES MORTON SALT, INC COMPASS MINERALS

P.O. BOX 527 P.O. BOX 190 713 WEST MAIN STREET 444 W LAKE STREET STE 3000 9900 WEST 109TH STREET STE 100

ELMIRA, NY  14902 MT. MORRIS NY 14510 GROVE CITY, PA 16127 CHICAGO, IL 60606 OVERLAND PARK, KS 66210

Alternate #1 NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

Snow & Ice Rock Salt in bulk Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
quantities to be delivered in

minimum quantities of forty
thousand (40,000) pound dump

truck loads.  FOB Bidder's Plant

Delivered before 7/1/20 3,222 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.78 $257,051.16 NO BID

Delivered before 10/1/20 3,222 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.78 $257,051.16 NO BID

Delivered after 10/1/20 3,222 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.78 $257,051.16 NO BID

Distance from bidder's bins to Hanover Square miles miles miles 58 miles miles

Bins are located at: Baltimore, MD

Travel time from bidder's bins to Center Square is minutes minutes minutes 1.12/ hour minutes minutes

                       (One-way travel time)

Alternate #2

Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Standard Calcium Chloride in

50 to 100 lb. bags or drums.

4 ton $690.00 $2,760.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32% mixture 4000 gal. NO BID NO BID 1.25/GAL $5,000.00 NO BID NO BID

OR

OR



BID  TABULATION  SHEET

BIDS OPENED  WEDNESDAY,  February 5, 2020 at 5:00 PM
Snow & Ice Rock Salt * ENVIROTECH SERVICES, INC * EASTERN SALT COMPANY, INCMID-ALANTIC SALT, LLC

910 54TH AVENUE #230 134 MIDDLE ST STE 210 P.O. BOX 135

GREELEYM CO 80634 LOWELL, MA 01852 GLADWYNE, PA 

Alternate #1 NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER NAME OF BIDDER

Snow & Ice Rock Salt in bulk Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

quantities to be delivered in

minimum quantities of forty

thousand (40,000) pound dump

truck loads.  FOB Bidder's Plant

Delivered before 7/1/20 3,222 ton NO BID * $65.00 $209,430.00 $67.50 $217,485.00

Delivered before 10/1/20 3,222 ton NO BID * $66.00 $212,652.00 $67.50 $217,485.00

Delivered after 10/1/20 3,222 ton NO BID * $67.00 $215,874.00 $67.50 $217,485.00

Distance from bidder's bins to Hanover Square miles 115 miles 94 miles miles miles

Bins are located at: Baltimore, MD / Claymont DE  Wilmington, De

Travel time from bidder's bins to Center Square is minutes 1.5 / hours minutes 120 minutes minutes minutes

                       (One-way travel time)

Alternate #2

Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Standard Calcium Chloride in * ($600 per ton)

50 to 100 lb. bags or drums. (corrected amount $2,400.00)

FOB Destination 4 ton $2,880.00 NO BID NO BID

Liquid Calcium Chloride, 32% mixture 4000 gal. $1.12 $4,480.00 NO BID NO BID

$15.00/50 lb bag

OR

OR


