

BID TABULATION SHEET

BIDS OPENED WEDNESDAY, February 5, 2020 at 5:00 PM

Petroleum Products

		* Mid-Atlantic Cooperative Solutions dba Areo Energy 230 Lincoln Way East New Oxford Pa 17350		PPC Lubricants, Inc 305 Micro Drive Jonestown, PA 17038		* Industrial Lubricants & Products P.O. Box 507 3337 N George St Emigsville, PA 17318			
		NAME OF BIDDER		NAME OF BIDDER		NAME OF BIDDER		NAME OF BIDDER	
<u>Gasoline</u>	<u>Approx Quantity</u>	<u>Trade Name</u>	<u>Price/Gal.</u>	<u>Trade Name</u>	<u>Price/Gal.</u>	<u>Trade Name</u>	<u>Price/Gal.</u>	<u>Trade Name</u>	<u>Price/Gal.</u>
1A. Regular Lead-Free Minimum 87 Octane	111,550 gal.*	u/b	\$1.7622		No Bid		No Bid		
<u>Motor Oil</u>				Drydene Syn Blend Plus 5w20	\$8.09	* Medallion	\$7.49		
2A. #5-20 Motor Oil Universal, multigrade/55 gal. drums	110 gal.		No Bid	Drydene all Syn 5w20	\$11.04	* Medallion	\$9.79		
2B. #5-20 Full Synthetic Oil in 55 gallon drums	110 gal.		No Bid	Drydene Diesel All 15w40 ck-4	\$8.30	* Dynaplex	\$7.68		
2C. #15-40 Motor Oil Universal, multigrade in bulk	1,000 gal.		No Bid	Drydene Diesel All 15w40 ck-4	\$9.20	* Dynaplex	\$8.98		
2D. #15-40 Motor Oil Universal, Multi-Grade in 55 gallon drums	385 gal.		No Bid	Drydene AW Hydraulic 46	\$6.76	* Dynaplex	\$5.89		
2E. #10-20 Hydraulic Oil/Low foaming action in bulk	600 gal.		No Bid	Drydene Aw Hydraulic 46	\$7.66	* Dynaplex	\$6.98		
2F. #10-20 Hydraulic Oil/low foaming action, in 55 gal drums	275 gal.		No Bid	Drydene Retrap lex EP#2	2.74/lb.	* Dynaplex	2.94/lb.		/lb.
<u>Chassis Lubricant</u>									
3. Multi-purpose Grease (meets new car warranty) in 120 lb. No-return drums	360 lbs.		No Bid						
<u>Diesel Oil</u>									
4. Diesel #2 Straight Run	\$100,650 gal.*	u/b	\$1.9581		No Bid		No Bid		
<u>Fuel Oil</u>									
5. Fuel Oil #2	13,000 gal.*	u/b	\$1.9618		No Bid		No Bid		
<u>Kerosene</u>									
6. Standard Kerosene	110 gal.		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		
<u>Dexron II Transmission Fluid</u>									
7. Transmission Fluid-Dexron II, in 55 gal. drums	110 gal.		No Bid	Dyrdene Trans All ATF D/M3	\$8.41	* Medallion	\$7.84		
Distance of Bidders Location from Hanover Center Square:		6 miles		68 miles		22 miles		miles	

Indicates successful bidder awarded at meeting held Wednesday, February 26, 2020 at 6:00 pm